
SUPPLEMENT No. 2 
το 

THE CYPRUS GAZETTE No. 4176 OF 6TH SEPTEMBER, 1958. 
LEGISLATION. 

THE STATUTE LAWS OF CYPRUS 
No. 29 or 1958. 

A LAW TO AMEND THE TURKISH FAMILY COURTS
 42 of 1954· 

LAW, 1954. 
HUGH FOOT,] [22nd August, 1958. 

Governor. 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor and 
Commander-in-Chief of the Colony of Cyprus as 

follows :— 
1. This Law may be cited as the Turkish Family Courts Short title. 

(Amendment) Law, 1958, and shall be read as one with the 
Turkish Family Courts Law, 1954, (hereinafter referred to as 42 of 1954. 
" the principal Law " ) , and the principal Law and this Law 
may together be cited as the Turkish Family Courts Laws, 
1954 a n d 1958. 

2. Section 14 of the principal Law is hereby amended by Amendment 
substituting the word " fifty " for the word '" ten " in the °£ s

th
c
e
tion 14 

second line thereof. principal 
Law. 

A. F. J. REDDAWAY, 
22nd August, 1958. Administrative Secretary. 

No. 30 or 1958. 
A LAW TO AMEND THE CUSTOMS TARIFF LAWS, 1954 το 1958. 64 of 1954 

29 of 1955 
HUGH FOOT,] [\th September, 1958. 3 } ° £ ^ 

Governor. 1 of 1957 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor and 28 of 1957 
Commander-in-Chief of the Colony of Cyprus as 1 0 o f l 9 5 S 

follows:— 
1.—(1) This Law may be cited as the Customs Tariff (Amend- Short title 

mem) (No. 2) Law, 1958 and shall be read as one with the Customs n̂d construe 
Tariff Laws, 1954 to 1958 (hereinafter referred to as "the principal 64 of 1954 
■̂ aw "), and the principal Law and this Law may together be cited 29 of 1955 

as the Customs Tariff Laws, 1954 to (No. 2) 1958. 2\ °| \IH 
(2) This Law shall come into operation on the 7th day of 1 of 1957 

September, 1958. 2I of 1957 
(163) 1 0 o ° f l 9 S 8 



164 

Amend
ment of 
P a r t i 
of the 
Second 
Schedule 
to the 
principal 
Law. 

First 
Schedule. 

Second 
Schedule. 

Third 
Schedule. 

2. Part I of the Second Schedule to the principal Law, as 
contained in the Customs Tariff (Amendment) Law, 1958, is 
hereby amended :— 

(i) in relation to the item numbers thereof set out in the 
first column of the First Schedule to this Law, by deleting 
all the details relating to such item numbers in each 
column thereof and by substituting therefor in each case 
the details relating to such item numbers set out in the 
appropriate columns of the First Schedule hereto ; 

(ii) in relation to the item numbers thereof set out in the 
first column of the Second Schedule to this Law, by 
making the amendments to the details relating to such 
item numbers therein set out against such item numbers 
in the second column of the said Second Schedule hereto ; 

(iii) in relation to item number " 931-02" (which refers to 
" Return Goods and Special Transactions") thereof, by 
deleting all the details relating to sub-item (B) (which refers 
to " Road vehicles, mechanically propelled, temporarily 
imported") in each column thereof and by substituting 
therefor the details set out in the appropriate column ot 
the Third Schedule to this Law ; 

(iv) by inserting the item number " 941-01 " in the first 
column thereof against the last item therein (which 
refers in the second column to " Gold bars, discs, ingots, 
sheets, strips, wire and similar forms "). 

Amend
ment of 
Part II 
of the 
Second 
Schedule 
to the 
principal 
Law. 

3. Part II of the Second Schedule to the principal Law, as 
contained in the Customs Tariff (Amendment) Law, 1958, is 
hereby amended :— 

(i) in the second paragraph of the Conditions at the end 
of item A2 by inserting after the word " sub-items " in 
the first line thereof the following :— 

" (a) The Army Kinema Corporation and The Royal 
Air Force Cinema Corporation," ; 

(ii) in item B4 by inserting after the word " film " which 
occurs in the first line thereof the words and brackets 
" (including sound tracks) ". 



165 
FresT SCHEDULE. 
(Section 2 (i)). 

Unit 

Description of Goods For 
Statis

tics 

For 
Duty 

Raw cotton, other than linters 
Soaps and cleansing preparations, as follows :

(a) Detergents, mixed, compounded, or 
otherwise prepared, whether or not 
in retail packages 

(b) Soaps, perfumed or toilet types . . 
(c) Soaps, common, in bars or blocks 
(d) Other 

Heels, soles, uppers, legs, tongues, welts and 
other prepared parts of footwear, of all ma
terials, as follows :— 
(«) Heels and soles of natural leather, classi

fied as such bv the Comptroller 
(b) Other · · . ·. 

Yarn of wool and hair, including mixed yarns 
of which the predominant material by 
weight is wool or hair, as follows :— 
(a) Oneply wool yarn admitted as such by 

the Comptroller 
(b) Other 

Yarn and thread of cotton, including mixed 
yarn and thread of which the predominant 
material by weight is cotton, as follows :— 
(«) Sewing thread, admitted as such by the 

Comptroller 

(δ) Knitting yarn, mercerised, admitted as 
such by the Comptroller 

(c) Knitting yarn, other 
(d) Other 

Yarn and thread of synthetic fibres and spun 
glass, including mixed yarn and thread of 
which the predominant material by weight 
is synthetic fibre or spun glass, as follows :
(a) Sewing thread, admitted as such by 

the Comptroller 

b) Single continuous filament, unspun 
(c) Other 

Cotton fabrics, bleached, dyed, mercerised, 
printed or otherwise finished, as follows :— 
(a) Gingham and similar yarndyed plain

weave light weight fabrics in plain 
colours, stripes or checks, classified 
as such by the Comptroller 

(6) Cotton gaberdine ; denim and similar 
yarndyed coating and trousering cloth, 
classified as such by the Comptroller . . 

(c) Other 
Fabrics woven or formed from synthetic fibres 

or spun glass, as follows :— 
(a) Heavy canvas, admitted as such by the 

Comptroller 

Oke 

Oke 
Oke 
Oke 
Oke 

Oke 
Oke 

Oke 
Oke 

Yard 

Oke 
Oke 
Oke 

Yard 

Oke 
Oke 

sq. yd. 

sq. yd. 

sq. yd. 

sq. yd. 

Value 

Value 
Value 
Value 
Value 

Value 
Value 

Value 
Value 

Per 1000 
yards 

Value 
Value 
Value 
or per 

oke 

Per 1000 
yards 
Value 
Value 

Value 
or per 
sq. yd. 

Value 
or per 
sq. yd. 
Value 

Value 

Prefer
ential 
Tariff 

Free 

24% 
16% 
12% 
16% 

16% 
8% 

Free 
1 W 

£0.005 
mils 

Free 
12% 

12% or 
£0.100 

mils 

£0.005 
mils 
Free 
12% 

16% or 
£0.020 

mils 

16% or 
£0.030 

mils 
16% 

Free 1% 



166 

Description of Goods 

Unit 

For 
Statis
tics 

— Prefer-
For ential 
Duty Tariff 

(b) Remnants, being pieces of a length not 
exceeding five yards per piece, when 
packed in separate complete packages 
and invoiced separately from other 
fabrics, admitted as such by the Comp
troller 

(c) Printed fabrics ; fabrics with stripes, 
checks or patterns of more than one 
colour 

((/) Other, including fabrics unbleached or 
of single colour, n.e.s. 

Felt including woven felted fabrics (except 
impregnated) and felt articles, n.e.s. as 
follows :— 
(«) Felt in the piece, admitted as such by 

the Comptroller 
(e) Other . . . . . . . . 

Internal combustion engines, including diesel 
and semi-diesel and parts thereof, n.e.s. as 
follows :— 
(a) For motor vehicles, classified as such 

bv the Comptroller 
(2>) Other 

Accounting machines, calculating machines, 
cash registers, dictaphones and similar office 
machines, n.e.s., as follows :— 
(«) Accounting and statistical machinery 

operated by means of punched cards, 
admitted as such by the Comptroller . . 

(b) Other 
Machinery for conveying and hoisting, such 

as capstans, conveyors, cranes, loaders, 
ropeways, winches ; machinery for exca
vating, such as dredges, grabs, graders, 
scrapers, shovels, trenchers ; machinery 
for road construction, such as road rollers, 
stone crushers ; and mining and drilling 
machinery, as follows :— 
(a) Dumpers and hoists for mounting on 

vehicles ; jacks for motor vehicles 
(b) Fscalators and passenger lifts, classified 

as such by the Comptroller 
(c) Self-propelled diggers, excavators, 

graders and similar earth moving and 
road construction units, classified as 
such by the Comptroller 

(d) Other, including parts for all machinery 
classified in this item 

Hosiery, as follows :—· 
(a) Stockings, except children's, containing 

not less than 75 per cent by weight of 
silk or synthetic fibre, classified as such 
by the Comptroller :— 

(i) Finished . . 

(ii) Unfinished for further processing 

Oke 

sq. yd. 

sq. yd. 

Oke 
Oke 

No. 
No. 

No. 

No. 

No. 

Doz. prs, 

Doz. prs. 

Value 
or per 

oke 

Value 
or per 
sq. yd. 

Value 

Value 
Value 

Value 

Value 
Value 

Value 

Value 

Value 

Value 
or per 

doz. prs. 
Value 

20% or 
£0.280 

mils 

20% or 
£0.033 
mils 

20% 

Free 
16% 

15% 
Free 

Free 
16% 

15% 

8% 

Free 

Free 

25% or 
£1.000 

mils 
25% 



167 

Description of Goods 

Unit 

For 
Statis
tics 

For 
Duty 

Prefer
ential 
Tariff 

101 
contd.) 

102) 
l~04j 

103) 
rl05 ) 

102 

(6) Socks, except children's, containing not 
less than 75 per cent by weight of silk 
or synthetic fibre, classified as such 
by the Comptroller 

(c) Stockings and socks, except children's, 
other . . 

(d) Other 
Underwear and nightvvear, including bath 

robes, bathing wear and shirts, as follows :— 
(«) Containing not less than 75 per cent by 

weight of silk or synthetic fibre, whether 
or not knit or made of knitted fabric, 
except children's wear, classified as 
such by the Comptroller 

(b) Other, knit or made of knitted fabric, 
including children's wear 

(c) Other . . 
Outerwear, n.e.s. as follows :— 

(a) Jumpers, sweaters, cardigans, pullovers, 
and blouses of all materials, knit or 
made of knitted fabric . . 

(b) Other . . . . 
Cameras, cinematograph projectors and pho

tographic, and cinematographic apparatus 
and appliances n.e.s. as follows :— 
(a) Cinematographic cameras designed for 

films of width 32 mm and over, cine
matographic sound film recorders, films 
for mechanical sound recording and 
similar apparatus and appliances gene
rally used in the commercial production 
of motion pictures of width 32 mm and 
over, admitted as such by the Comp
troller 

(6) Other 

Doz. prs. 

Doz. prs. 

Doz. prs. 

Doz. & 
oke 

Doz. & 
oke. 

Doz. 

Doz. 

— 

No. 
No. 

Value 
or per 

doz. prs. 

Value 
or per 

doz. prs. 
Value 

Value 
or per 
doz. or 
per oke 

Value or 
per oke 

Value 

Value or 
per doz. 

Value 

Value 
Value 

25% or 
£0.360 

mils 

25% or 
£0.240 

mils 
25°·' 

25% or 
£0.480 
mils or 
£0.500 

mils 

25 % or 
£0.500 

mils 
25% 

25% or 
£0.480 

mils 
25% 

Free 
50% 

34 

1 

34 
£C 

η 
3 

34 
£C 
mi 
£C 

η 

34 
£0 

η 
3 

34 
£0 

η 
3 

1 
6 



168 
SECOND SCHEDULE. 

{Section 2 (ii)). 

Amendments 

in the 

in the 

After the word " pork " in the second column insert the words and brackets 
" (not in airtight containers) ". 

For the words and brackets " (not canned) " in the second column sub
stitute the words and brackets " (not in airtight containers) ". 

Delete the words " and including bacon, ham and salt pork, canned " in 
the second column. 

In sub-item (b), for " £0.690 mils " in the fifth column substitute 
" £0.620 mils " . 

Delete the words "including the products known as 'cocose', 
' vegetaline ' and the like " in the second column. 

In sub-item (c), delete the word " naphthalene " in the second column. 
In sub-item (d), after the word " Rennet " in the second column insert a 

comma and the word " naphthalene ". 
After the word " all " in the second column insert the word " textile ". 
In sub-item (c) after the word " o ther" in the second column insert the 

words " including parts and accessories not assignable to a particular class of 
electrical machinery ". 

In sub-item (a) after the word " vans ; " in the second column in the sixth 
line insert the words " dumper or tipper lorries, of payload weight not less 
than 20 tons, specially designed for use in excavating and levelling operations; ". 

In sub-item (a) after the words " Miners' safety lamps," in the second 
column insert the words " operating theatre lamps,". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for 
sixth column substitute " 34% ". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for 
sixth column substitute " 34% ". 

In sub-item (b), for " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 
" 29% " in the sixth column substitute " 34% ". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for " 29% " in the 
sixth column substitute " 34% ". 

(i) In sub-item (a), for " 20% " in the fifth column substitute 
and for " 29% " in the sixth column substitute " 34% ". 

(ii) In sub-item (6), for " 20% " in the fifth column substitute 
and for " 29% " in the sixth column substitute " 34% ". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for " 29% 
sixth column substitute " 34% ". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for " 25% 
sixth column substitute " 30% ". 

In sub-item (i), for " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% ' 
" 25% " in the sixth column substitute " 30% ". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for " 25% " in the 
sixth column substitute " 30% ". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for " 40% " in the 
sixth column substitute " 45% ". 

For " 20% " in the fifth column substitute " 25% " and for " 30% " in the 
sixth column substitute " 35% ". 

In sub-item (a), in the second column after the words " or not " insert a 
semi-colon and add the words " graphic art films for lithography admitted as 
such by the Comptroller ". 

In sub-item (a), after the word " Comptroller ; " in the second column insert 
the words " gas-masks, dust masks and similar respiratory appliances ; ". 

2Q o,· 
•6 7 /ς, 

" 29°' 

25% " and for 

' 25% " 

' 25% " 

' in the 

" in the 

and for 



169 
THIRD SCHEDULE. 

(Section 2 (iii)). 

Description of Goods 

Unit 

For 
Statis
tics 

For 
Dun

Prefer
ential 
Tariff 

General 
Tariff 

(B) Road vehicles, mechanically propelled, air
craft and pleasure boats, temporarily imported, 
as follows :—■ 

(1) Vehicles, aircraft and pleasure boats 
(including spare parts thereof and any wire
less receiving set incorporated therein), im
ported by or for the use of approved visitors, 
which are the subject of temporary im
portation papers issued by a club or asso
ciation recognised by the Governor as being 
authorised to issue such papers under the 
provisions of any international convention 
relating to motor vehicles, aircraft or plea
sure boats to which the Government may 
be an adherent, and in conformity with any 
standard forms agreed upon therein as being 
valid for the temporary importation into 
the Colony of such motor vehicles, aircraft 
or pleasure boats 

(2) Vehicles, aircraft and pleasure boats 
(including any spare parts and any wireless 
receiving sets incorporated therein) imported 
by or for the use of visitors, subject to the 
payment to the Collector, at the time of 
clearance after importation, of a deposit 
equal to the Customs duty payable thereon 
as assessed by him at the time, refundable 
in full upon exportation of the vehicle, air
craft or pleasure boat (including any spare 
parts, and any wireless receiving set incorpo
rated therein) 

Provided that, in cases to which para
graphs (1) and (2) apply :— 

(i) the vehicles, aircraft or pleasure boats 
(including any spare parts and any 
wireless receiving sets incorporated 
therein) are exported within six 
months of the date of clearance from 
Customs after importation into the 
Colony, or such further period as 
the Comptroller may allow, and 
subject to any other conditions he 
may impose in consideration of ex
tending the aforesaid period of six 
months ; 

(ii) the owner shall satisfy the Collector 
that any spare parts of any vehicle, 
aircraft or pleasure boat which are 
not produced upon exportation, have 
been fitted to the motor car or other 
motor vehicle, aircraft or pleasure 
boat ; or 

Free 

Free Free 



170 

Item 
No. 

931-02 
(contd.) 

Description of Goods 

(iii) if, due to accident to any such vehicle, 
aircraft or pleasure boat (including 
any spare parts and any wireless 
receiving set incorporated therein) 
the owner notifies the Comptroller in 
writing that, in consequence of such 
accident he is not prepared to export 
the vehicle, aircraft or pleasure boat 
(including, as the case may be, any 
spare parts thereof or any wireless 
receiving set incorporated therein), 
the aforementioned temporary im
portation papers shall be discharged 
or the aforementioned deposit shall 
be refunded, on such of the afore
mentioned articles as he shall, with 
the approval of the Comptroller, 
either abandon to the Government 
free of any charge, or destroy or 
cause to be destroyed at his own 
expense, in such manner as the 
Comptroller may direct. 

(3) For the purpose of this sub-item the 
word " visi tor" shall have the meaning 
set out in paragraph (3) of sub-item (A) of 
this item. 

Unit 

For 
Statis

tics 

For 
Duty 

Prefer
ential 
Tariff 

General 
Tariff 

A. F. J. REDDAWAY, 
Administrative Secretary. 4th September, 1958. 

Printed by the Government Printer at the Government Printing Office, Nicosia, Cyprus. 


